
3121201t W.'s First Enron Connection: Update on...

ffiwffiffiffiffiwffiffiffi

Home I About Us I Donate I Signup lArchiws I Search Wednesday, March 02, 2011

& Printur, Friendly Version ItI E-Muit ThisArticle
Published on Thursday, March 7, 2002 in The Nation

W.'s First Enron Connection:
Update on the Bush-Enron Oil Deal
by David Corn
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Did George w. Bush once hare a financial relationship with Enron? ln 1g86,
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dire need of help. Bush's business association with Enron, it seems, has not
previously been reported.

ln 1986, spectrum 7, a priwtely owned oil company chaired by Bush faced
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according to "First Son," Bill Minutaglio's biography of Bush. Under this deal,
Bush ended up owning about 15 percent of Spectrum 7. By the end of 1g85,
Spectrum's fortunes had rer,ersed. With oil prices fulling, the company was
losing money and on the rcrge of collapse. To sare the firm, Bush began
negotiations to sell Spectrum 7 to Harken Energy, a large Dallas-based energy
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The deal took months to work out. ln september of 19g6, spectrum 7 and
Harken announced they had reached an agreement. Spectrum 7 shareholders,
under the plan, would receirc Harken stock. Bush publicly said that Spectrum 7
would continue to operate in Midland, Texas, as a wholly-owned subsidiary of
Harken and that he would become an actir,e member of Harken's board of
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would provide $2.25 million in Harken stock for a company with a net r,alue close
to $t.a million.
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Corporation, announced on October 16, 1986, that it had completed a well
producing both oil and natural gas in Martin County, Texas. An Enron Oil and
Gas press release reported the well was producing 24,000 cubic feet of natural
gas and 41 1 barrels of oil per day in the Belspec Fusselman Field, 15 miles
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acquisition was announced in early Nor,ember.

To spell it out: George w. Bush and Enron oil and Gas were in business
together in 1986-when Ken Lay was head of Enron. (Lay was named Enron
chairman in February of that year.) How did this deal come about? was this the
only project in which Bush and Enron were partners? A call placed to the white
House produced no response. Karen Denne, an Enron spokeswoman, says "l
can't tell you anything about" that project, explaining Enron ',sold all its
domestic exploration and production assets about two years ago to EoG
Reources" and probably did not retain records regarding that well. As for the
possibility spectrum 7 inr,ested in other Enron lentures, she notes, "you're
referencing something that happened in 1gg6. I can check, but we're pretty
short-staffed now." Elizabeth hers, a spokeswoman for EoG Resources
(formerly Enron oil and Gas), says, "lf we did hale any records on that well, it
would be nothing that we would share with the public. we do not disclose the
details or specifics of who we har,e well interests with.,'

After the Enron affair began generating font-page headlines, Bush attempted to
distance himself from Enron and Lay. ln early January, the president claimed he
and Lay had not always been close pals. "Hewas a supporterof [Texas
Gowrnorl Ann Richards in my run [against her] in 1gg4,'; Bush asserted, noting
he did not get "to know Ken" and work with him until after he won that election.
But campaign records show Lay donated three times as much money to Bush
in that race as he did to Richards. Moreorcr, contacts between Lay and the
Bush family pre-dated that campaign. ln 1gg2, Lay chaired the host committee
forthe 1992 Republican conr,ention in Houston, where Bush,s fatherwon his
second presidential nomination. And Lay was a sleeporer guest at the white
House of President George H.W. Bush.

The Enron-George w. Bush connection goes back further than the president
has suggested. But does that mean the relationship between the younger Bush
and Lay stretches to the mid-1980s? The deal could har,e happened without
contact between Lay and Bush. But most company heads would be interested
to know that the son of the sitting Mce-president had inrcsted in one of their
enterprises. lf Lay had been aware of the partnership, that would not pror,e the
two were pals or that Bush and spectrum 7 had receir,ed undue consideration
from Enron. But gilen Enron's penchant to use political ties to win and protect
business opportunities, it is tough not to wonder if this Bush-Enron rcnture
inrclwd special arrangements. This is certainly one more Enron partnership that
desenes scrutlny-especially since George w. Bush has yet to acknowledge it.
The Spectrum-Enron deal is either an odd historical coincidence or an indication
there's more to learn about the Bush-Enron association.

NOW FOR AN UPDATE ON THE BUSH-ENRON OIL DEAL:

on March 6, two days after this story was first posted, "The New york llmes',
ran on the front page of its business section a story headlined, "Bush Joined
Unit of Enron ln '86 Venture To seek oil." The article, written by Jim yardley,
essentially reported the facts noted abole. Halflruay into the piece, it noted,I'A
columnist in The Nation, the liberal politicaljournal,...wrote about the deal this
week in its online edition."

while the Bush white House did not respond to a request from "The Nation', for
information, white House spokesman Dan Barilett told the "llmes', the
President "has no recollection of this specific deal." Barflett maintained that in
19BG spectrum 7 was inrolred in more than 175 wells. Ted collins Jr., who was
president of Enron oil and Gas at the time, told the newspaper that Bush did not
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ha\re "a speciar ,""rrtiy;3nl[pt#ii",f"qtffifl?]' tPjnlS,JSb asserted that Lay
back then "wouldn't hare known who spectrum 7 was and that George w. Bush' 
had anything to do with a company called Spectrum 7."

since the story was originally posted, I har,e found records suggesting that
Bush's spectrum 7 had a second partnershipwith Enron. ln May of 1gg5, a
subsidiary of lnterNorth, an omaha-based energy company, announced the
completion of a well in Martin county, Texas. According to "pR Newswire," the
company said that Spectrum 7 owned an 18.75 percent interest in the well. (The
rest was held by the lnterNorth subsidiary.) The well, like the one mentioned
abore, was located at the Belspec Fusselman Field. That same month,
lnterNorth merged with Houston Natural Gas (HNG)--which gale birth to Enron.
HNG/lnterNorth changed its name to Enron in 1g96, and the lnterNorth
subsidiary that had inr,ested in the well with Spectrum 7 became part of Enron
Oil and Gas. lf Spectrum 7 and Enron Oil and Gas had retained their interests in
the well, that would mean that Bush's oil company was in partnership with Enron
before the deal reported aborc. since Bush, according to his spokesperson,
does not have a memory for such details and EOG Resources says it will not
release any information about wells it has owned, it will be tough to confirm that
the lnterNorth-Spectrum 7 r,enture became an Enron-Spectrum 7 enterprise.

on another, more important, Enron-Bush point: way back in 1gg4,l reported
that Rodolfo Terragno, a former Argentine cabinet minister, had claimed that
when he headed the Public Works and Services Department in 1988, George W.,
Bush, whom Terragno did not know, called him and pressured Terragno to iward
a pipeline contract worth hundreds of millions of dollars to Enron. (see
http:/iwww.thenation.com/doc.mhtml?i=20020204&s=corn.) Terragno, who said
he resisted this and subsequent importuning, could not provide proof that the
call had occurred. (How can you pro\e you were phoned by the son of the Vice-
President?) Bush's aides denied Teragno's account. But it's worth taking a
second look at those denials.

At the time I was pursuing the Terragno story, Bush was running for Texas
go\ernor, and I asked the campaign whether Bush had spoken to Terragno about
the pipeline project and whether he had any business relationship with Enron.
Bush aide Karen Hughes faxed me a terse statement: "The answer to your
questions are no and none. Your questions are apparently addressed to the
wrong person." An Enron spokesperson said, "Enron has not had any business
dealings with George w. Bush, and we don't harc any knowledge that he was
inrclrcd in a pipeline project in Argentina.',

The recent news about the 1986 Enron-Bush r,enture in the Belspec Fusselman
Field undermines (to be polite about it) those 1994 statements from Bush and
Enron denying any business relationship between the scion and the company.
The existence of this oil partnership in 1986 (orone in 1g85) has no bearing on
the rcracity of Terragno's tale. But it shows the credibility of the Bush gang anO
that of Enron desene questioning when either one is talking about the otnJr.
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